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Barrier Free Campaign at Singhadarbar  
 

Independent Living Center Kathmandu has organized Barrier Free Campaign Program 
with the support of Ministry of Women, Children and Social Welfare on 29th Asar 2067 
at Singha Darbar, Kathmandu. The program was hold at Singha Darbar infront of the 
main entrance of Ministry of Finance, Office of Prime Minister, Ministry of Physical 
Planning and Works, Ministry of Information and Communication and Ministry of 
Women, Children and Social Welfare. The prior aim of the program is to appeal the 
stakeholders with the demands so that they can formulate necessary plans and policies, 
to provide awareness to the high level planners, policymakers and beurocrates regarding 
the problems and contemproray issue of people of disability, to enhance the interaction 
of PWDs with stakeholders and to encourage groupwork among the participants and 
make them realize that they are not alone in their struggle. The event was witnessed 
and participated by a mass of over a hundred people with disability along with the 
presence of journalists, human right activists and personal assistants.  
 
The keen and excited participants gathered in a semi circle around a banner infront of 
the main intrance of the Ministry of Finance. The Secretary of Finance Rameshwor 
Khanal and Krishna Hari Baskota took their time off their busy schedule to come for the 
campaign. Mr. Rameshwor Khanal and Mr. Krishna Hari Baskota praised the peace and 
right based campaign and offered his congratulations to the people with disabilities who 
have moved towards organizing and implementing such a wonderful event. They said 
that they have fulfilled the demands of the IL before and will certainly continue to do it 
in the future. After all the matters put forth and considered, the Ministry open heartedly 
accepted the demands and even considered it's place in the coming Budget Plan. 
  
The second stop was the Prime Minister's Office; the Chief Secretary Madhav Ghimire 
came to attend the event. After putting forth the demands the Chief Secretary Dr. 
Madhav Ghimire talked about the awareness that the ministry has about the disability 
and he will look positively into the matter and the appeal by the IL will be kept into 
consideration. The Ministry of Physical Planning and Works Secretary Mr. Dip Basnyat 
praised the campaigns that appeals will be taken in to consideration and implemented 
but along with it also requests the participants to have patience because the execution 
might take some time.  
 
Similarly, the campaign got acquainted with Mr. Sankar Prasad Pokharel, the Minister and 
Mr. Susil Ghimire, the Secretary of the Ministry of Information and Communication. 
After the hearing the appeal, the minister Mr. Sankar Prasad Pokharel clarified the 
reason why the ambience of the ministry was yet not friendly to the people with 
physical disability. He further added that he had appealed for the construction of those 
commodities but that was to no avail. However, he promised to revive them again. He 
also promised to keep under control the terms used for addressing the disables in the 
television and radios which rather sounds offensive to them. Also the inaudible will be 
considered the benefits of free sums services in order for them to communicate better.  
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Finally, the campaign was hold at the ministry of women, children and social welfare. 
The Ministers Mr. Sarbadev Ojha and Ram Bacchan Yadav started by saying that disables 
are one among the 4 pillars of the society and the economy of the nation can't do 
without them. They further said that the wants and the demands kept forth are not new 
and they only need to be revived. And they also envisioned the establishment of an 
organization in the coming fiscal year which caters to the necessity of the people with 
disabilities. The legal issues, which are not given much priority, will be prioritized. The 
secretary made an illustrative speech on the contemporary moral, legal and social issues. 
The basic motive of the event was briefed by the Secretary General, Krishna Gautam of 
Independent Living Center Kathmandu. And the letter of appeal was read by Tek 
Bahadur Gurung. The ending speech was delivered by the President of Independent 
Living Centre, Ganesh K.C. and the treasurer of IL Dhurba Neupane. Bhoj Raj Shrestha, 
the member of Independent Living Centre ran the campaigns. 
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